
Rex 

From: Rex [rexwarlick@cox.net]

Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2011 1:09 PM

To: 'sglendora@aol.com'; 'weper4m@yahoo.com'

Subject: FW: Helmet Order
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Just a note to let you know I have given up on getting either the helmet I paid for or my money 
back.  I will, however, be spreading the names Mark Raynes, Sports Equipment Extreme and 
MRF around to all my significant list of riding friends and event organizers..  And if I ever run 
across you again in my travels Mark, I promise to take my $49.20 worth in satisfaction… 
             
http://www.okiepages.com/raynes.htm 

  
Rex Warlick 
American Legion Riders Post 1340 
Oklahoma City, OK 
  

 
  

  

From: Rex [mailto:rexwarlick@cox.net]  
Sent: Thursday, December 02, 2010 8:18 AM 

To: 'sglendora@aol.com'; 'weper4m@yahoo.com' 

Subject: FW: Helmet Order 
  

As you apparently cannot fulfill the order, please refund the amount paid as reflected on 

the attached receipt. 

  

Thank you! 

Rex Warlick 

405-249-5927 

  

From: Rex [mailto:rexwarlick@cox.net]  

Sent: Saturday, November 20, 2010 10:41 AM 
To: 'weper4m@yahoo.com' 

Cc: 'sglendora@aol.com' 
Subject: FW: Helmet Order 
  
Have received no response to any of these.. 

From: Rex [mailto:rexwarlick@cox.net]  
Sent: Friday, November 19, 2010 10:30 AM 

To: 'sglendora@aol.com' 
Subject: FW: Helmet Order 
  

????????????????????????????????? 

  

I know I said no rush but would like to know if you got the order straightened out and if it 

is in the works..   Thanks! 

  



From: Rex [mailto:rexwarlick@cox.net]  

Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2010 6:16 PM 
To: 'sglendora@aol.com' 

Subject: Helmet Order 
  

Hi Candy (or Kandy or Candi or Kandie or…….) 

  

You left a message about a helmet I ordered at Vegas BikeFest..   I wish I could remember exactly what it 

looks like.  It is not in the catalog we picked up at the booth (leatherup.com) and I didn’t find it on that web 

site either..  It is a shorty with an redish orange flame job and small skull or snarling set of teeth on the crown 

in the flames..   I think the base color was black.   Size large I believe.  The guy in the booth told me he had all 

this but I guess it didn’t get passed on to you. 

  

There is no rush on it.  If you have a place I could look at more pic’s or you can send me some of those that are 

similar maybe I can pick it out.. 

  

This is my email and my shipping address is: 

  

4521 SE 33rd St 

Del City, OK 73115-3507 

  

Rex Warlick 

405-249-5927 (cell) 

405-672-9354 (home) 
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